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A much improved and superbly presented three/four bedroom semi-
detached house with a driveway for two/three cars, a carport, a garage, 
and a beautifully landscaped, private rear garden. The property is situated 
in a prime location within Great Denham, offering an uninterrupted outlook 
over greenery leading into the scenic Country Park. 

The light and airy accommodation is spread across three floors and 
includes a reception hall with Karndean flooring extending into the 
kitchen/dining/family room, which features an attractive panel-effect wall, 
a useful storage cupboard, and a cloakroom. The kitchen is equipped with 
high gloss units and integrated appliances, opening into the dining/family 
area with a bay window and double doors, providing plenty of space for 
both dining and relaxation. 

On the first floor, you’ll find the versatile fourth bedroom/sitting room and 
the main bedroom, which has built-in wardrobes, a feature panel-effect 
wall, and an ensuite shower room. The second floor offers two further 
double bedrooms and a family bathroom. 

Externally, the property benefits from a small enclosed front garden, a 
spacious driveway with a carport and a garage, and a rear garden that’s 
not overlooked. The thoughtfully landscaped garden measures 40ft x 26ft 
and features a lower lawn with raised borders and steps leading up to a 
large decked seating area, perfect for entertaining 

Beautifully presented and ideally positioned close to local shops and 
amenities, this home offers the best of both worlds - peaceful surroundings 
and easy access to modern conveniences. Viewing is highly 
recommended. 

* 3/4 Double Bedrooms 

* Open Plan Kitchen/Dining/Family Room 

* Cloakroom 

* Ensuite 

* Double Glazing 

* Gas Radiator Heating 

* Attractive Landscaped Gardens 

* Garage, Carport, Driveway 

* Sought After Location 

* Tastefully Presented Throughout 
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 Money Laundering Regulations:  Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation and we would ask for co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing a sale. Agents Notes: The agent has not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures & fittings or 

services and so cannot verify that they are in working order or fit for the purpose. A buyer is advised to obtain verification from their solicitor or surveyor. All photographs shown are for illustration purposes only and may depict items that are not for sale or included in the sale of the 

property. Please note that we have not checked the situation with regards to planning consents, building regulation consents and any other relevant consents relating to this property and therefore,   any interested purchaser should carry out their own enquiries with the appropriate 

authorities. All measurements are approximate and for guidance only. The particulars do not form part of any contract and all properties are offered subject to contract.  Neither Taylor Brightwell nor any  of its employees or agents has any authority to make or give any representation 

or warranty whatsoever in relation to this property. 

 

 


